
Marion Satherley <marionawayfromhome@gmail.com>

Re: Overdue Community Grants Accountability Form 2022
3 messages

Aileen Connell <aileen.connell@gmail.com> Tue, Sep 5, 2023 at 8:15 PM
To: Grants <grants@tasman.govt.nz>
Cc: OurMapua email <info@ourmapua.org>

Hi Mel

Please see attached.  Please note we have not spent all the monies kindly granted by the TDC as the units have
only been used once in the last 12 months.  The remaining funds will remain "ring fenced" for future use on
AED's.  We have also not managed to get the planned training organised due to people availability.  It remains one
of our planned activities when time and people permit

Please let me know if you need further info

many thanks

Aileen
MDCA Treasurer

On Tue, 5 Sept 2023 at 11:02, Grants <grants@tasman.govt.nz> wrote:

Sorry Aileen,

 

Your grant was for $863.90 towards training and new AED parts.

Thanks,
Mel

 

From: Aileen Connell <aileen.connell@gmail.com>
Sent: Tuesday, September 5, 2023 10:57 AM
To: Grants <grants@tasman.govt.nz>
Subject: Re: Overdue Community Grants Accountability Form 2022

 

Hi Melanie 

 

I think you have the wrong contact details.  I am the treasurer for the Mapua and Districts Community Association 

 

Cheers

 

Aileen

 

On Tue, 5 Sept 2023, 10:48 Grants, <grants@tasman.govt.nz> wrote:

Hi Aileen

 

This Community Grant from 2022 is “towards advancing the CCTV coverage for the Murchison District” and $3,000 was
allocated.

Please see attached your application.
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Thanks

Mel

 

From: Aileen Connell <aileen.connell@gmail.com>
Sent: Monday, September 4, 2023 7:42 PM
To: Grants <grants@tasman.govt.nz>
Subject: Re: Overdue Community Grants Accountability Form 2022

 

Hi Melanie

 

Could you help me and advise which grant this was for?  I thought I had sent the correct form in.

 

Many thanks

 

Aileen

MDCA treasurer 

 

On Mon, 4 Sep 2023, 17:14 Grants, <grants@tasman.govt.nz> wrote:

Kia ora,

 

Please could you return an accountability form as soon as possible for your 2022 Community Grant
funded project by following the link here: Community Grant Accountability Form 2022

 

Please note that if you have applied in the current Community Grants funding round, we must
receive the Accountability Form prior to any further funding being granted.

 

Thank you,

 

Ngā mihi

 

Melanie Ellis Service and Strategy

Administration Officer ‑ Service & Strategy

DDI +64 3 543 8446
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Jim Vause <vauses@gmail.com> Wed, Sep 6, 2023 at 7:12 PM
Reply-To: vauses@gmail.com
To: Paul McIntosh <pmcintosh64@yahoo.com>, Aileen Connell <aileen.connell@gmail.com>, Marion Satherley
<marionawayfromhome@gmail.com>, Anne-Marie Beeler <chris.gintrap@gmail.com>, Henk Vermeer <henk69vermeer@gmail.com>,
Bruno Lemke <bruno.lemke@xtra.co.nz>, Neville and Helen <n-h.bibby@actrix.co.nz>

Re the AED funding and grants

If we have the funding, we could get in training for resuscitation by a certificated provider, as opposed to just the AED training that I
can do and which costs us nothing. I suspect that, given that full resuscitation training is a time commitment of at least half a day,
there might not be many takers, however I think it would be a good idea to approach the Business association and discuss with
them about identifying the training needs of the businesses (i.e. staff) and seeing whether a combined training session might be
useful. For instance the medical centre will have a clear training need as per their Cornerstone Quality program.

Thoughts?

Jim

On Tue, Sep 5, 2023 at 5:51 PM Paul McIntosh <pmcintosh64@yahoo.com> wrote:
Fyi...

Sent from Yahoo Mail on Android
[Quoted text hidden]

Henk Vermeer <henk69vermeer@gmail.com> Thu, Sep 7, 2023 at 11:02 AM
To: vauses@gmail.com
Cc: Paul McIntosh <pmcintosh64@yahoo.com>, Aileen Connell <aileen.connell@gmail.com>, Marion Satherley
<marionawayfromhome@gmail.com>, Anne-Marie Beeler <chris.gintrap@gmail.com>, Bruno Lemke <bruno.lemke@xtra.co.nz>,
Neville and Helen <n-h.bibby@actrix.co.nz>

Hi all.

I think that some sort of training on how to use the AED is a great idea, 
especially if we receive funding to do so. 

Kind regards
Henk
[Quoted text hidden]
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